
 
Reference:  FOI 00331 BOB ICB 
 
Subject:  Children and Young People 
 
I can confirm that the ICB does not hold some of the information requested; please see responses below: 
 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

1. Please set out how much money your integrated care board spent 
on hospice care for children and young people with life-limiting or 
life-threatening conditions between 6 April 2022 and 5 April 2023. 
Please provide a total, in addition to a breakdown of funding per 
children’s hospice organisation.  

£344,000 1 April 2022 to 31 March 2023 - NHS financial year 
 
Helen and Douglas House - £232,419 
Alexander Devine - £76,000 
Rennie Grove - £35,581 

2. Please set out how many children and young people with life-
limiting or life-threatening conditions who live in your integrated 
care board footprint accessed hospice care between 6 April 2022 
and 5 April 2023. Please provide a total, in addition to a breakdown 
of funding per hospice organisation. 

BOB ICB does not hold this data.  
 
Please see the attached National Child Mortality Report  

3. Please set out how many children and young people with life-
limiting or life-threatening conditions who live in your integrated 
care board footprint could benefit from children’s hospice care. 

BOB ICB does not hold this data. 
 
Children on a palliative pathway in BOB do have the option to be under 
Hospice Care and are told of the benefits (but family choice will be a factor in 
to this). 

4. Please set out how much money your integrated care board plans 
to spend on hospice care for children and young people with life-
limiting or life-threatening conditions between 6 April 2022 and 5 
April 2023. Please provide a total, in addition to a breakdown of 
funding per hospice organisation. 

As per Question 1 same dates 

 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 11 May 232023 and has been authorised for release by Catherine Mountford, Director of 
Governance NHS Buckinghamshire, Oxfordshire, and Berkshire West (BOB) ICB.    
 
 
SIGNED: ________________________ 


